

# Board of Park Commissioners Approval Form

**PROJECT NAME: 2021 Golf Course Tree Maintenance**

**Quest Number:**

**Project Approval Request**

**Scope of Work:**

All three of the Fort Wayne Parks and Recreation golf courses are in need of tree maintenance. This project will address the 39 dead trees presenting the highest level of risk. Additionally, 14 trees will be pruned in an effort to make the courses more playable.

Bids were accepted for each of the three courses separately from five local tree care companies. The Crossing International Xtreme Tree Service was the lowest most responsive bidder for each of the three golf courses.

**Funding Source:** Budget - 121

**Estimated Start:** January 2022

**Estimated Completion:** March 2022

**Board Approval:**

We are asking the board to approve a tree maintenance contract with The Crossing International, Xtreme Tree Service at a total cost of \$31,285.00.

---

The Fort Wayne Parks and Recreation and the Board of Park Commissioners, met to host their regularly scheduled monthly Board meeting on **December 9<sup>th</sup>, 2021**, to approve funding for the above referenced contract, in the amount of **\$31,285.00**.

***We, the Board of Park Commissioners, on the date stated do ATTEST,*** and sign to the above referenced and attached documents, and approve as presented.

---

**Richard Samek, President**

---

**Pamela Kelly, Vice President**

---

**William Zielke, Commissioner**

---

**Justin Shurley, Commissioner**

# 2021 Golf Course Maintenance Bid Tab

## Foster Golf Bid Tab

Tree Number	Contractor:				
	Mudrack (Quote)	Monster (Quote)	Crossing (Quote)	Lumberjack (Quote)	Worx (Quote)
1	\$ 720.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 645.00	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 608.00
2	\$ 480.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 530.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 590.00
3	\$ 480.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 155.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 507.00
4	\$ 720.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 507.00
5	\$ 480.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 550.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 608.00
6	\$ 960.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,075.00	\$ 2,850.00	\$ 1,350.00
7	\$ 420.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 270.00
8	\$ 420.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 550.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 777.00
9	\$ 1,440.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 965.00	\$ 2,100.00	\$ 1,215.00
10	\$ 1,080.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,900.00	\$ 810.00
11	\$ 720.00	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 345.00	\$ 1,250.00	\$ 675.00
12	\$ 1,440.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 3,100.00	\$ 1,620.00
13	\$ 240.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 169.00
14	\$ 960.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 565.00	\$ 2,100.00	\$ 777.00
15	\$ 240.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 169.00
16	\$ 480.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 270.00
17	\$ 480.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 372.00
18	\$ 720.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 345.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 540.00
19	\$ 960.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 485.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 574.00
20	\$ 1,920.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,350.00	\$ 4,100.00	\$ 1,755.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$ 15,360.00</b>	<b>\$ 18,800.00</b>	<b>\$ 12,595.00</b>	<b>\$ 28,250.00</b>	<b>\$ 14,163.00</b>

<b>Cost per tree 12" and under</b>	\$ 480.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 273.00
<b>T&amp;M Rate per hour</b>	\$ 240.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 162.50

## McMillen Golf Bid Tab

Tree Number	Contractor:				
	Mudrack (Quote)	Monster (Quote)	Crossing (Quote)	Lumberjack (Quote)	Worx (Quote)
1	\$ 240.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 260.00
2	\$ 1,920.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 1,615.00	\$ 4,100.00	\$ 1,560.00
3	\$ 480.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 520.00
4	\$ 480.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 390.00
5	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 570.00	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 1,008.00
6	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 4,950.00	\$ 1,690.00

7	\$ 2,160.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 2,150.00	\$ 4,100.00	\$ 1,690.00
8	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 1,060.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,105.00
9	\$ 1,080.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 510.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 618.00
10	\$ 540.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 155.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 488.00
11	\$ 1,920.00	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 1,525.00	\$ 2,950.00	\$ 1,430.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$ 13,620.00</b>	<b>\$ 13,550.00</b>	<b>\$ 9,945.00</b>	<b>\$ 23,350.00</b>	<b>\$ 10,759.00</b>

<b>Cost per tree 12" and under</b>	\$ 480.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 273.00
<b>T&amp;M Rate per hour</b>	\$ 240.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 162.50

### Shoaff Golf Bid Tab

Contractor:

Tree Number	Mudrack	Monster	Crossing	Lumberjack	Worx
	(Quote)	(Quote)	(Quote)	(Quote)	(Quote)
1	\$ 240.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 228.00
2	\$ 480.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 390.00
3	\$ 620.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 725.00	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 494.00
4	\$ 480.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 494.00
5	\$ 480.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 423.00
6	\$ 480.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 390.00
7	\$ 960.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 1,900.00	\$ 520.00
8	\$ 1,440.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 1,430.00
9	\$ 720.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 520.00
10	\$ 480.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 364.00
11	\$ 240.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 425.00	\$ 260.00
12	\$ 480.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 390.00
13	\$ 240.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 163.00
14	\$ 720.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 870.00	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 715.00
15	\$ 240.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 228.00
16	\$ 480.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 234.00
17	\$ 720.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 585.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 748.00
18	\$ 720.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 870.00	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 748.00
19	\$ 480.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 340.00	\$ 550.00	\$ 260.00
20	\$ 240.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 228.00
21	\$ 720.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 365.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 553.00
22	\$ 720.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 553.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$ 12,380.00</b>	<b>\$ 14,750.00</b>	<b>\$ 8,745.00</b>	<b>\$ 17,525.00</b>	<b>\$ 10,333.00</b>

<b>Cost per tree 12" and under</b>	\$ 480.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 273.00
------------------------------------	-----------	-----------	-----------	-----------	-----------

<b>T&amp;M Rate per hour</b>	\$ 240.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 162.50
------------------------------	-----------	-----------	-----------	-----------	-----------

# Board of Park Commissioners Approval Form

**PROJECT NAME: 2021 Street Tree Stump Removal**

**Quest Number: 8033359**

**Project Approval Request**

**Scope of Work:**

After removing a tree from within the city's right-of-way, a stump is left behind. This contract is for the removal of these stumps. A complete stump removal includes grinding of the stump, removal of stump debris, backfilling with soil, application of grass seed, and a straw top dressing.

Unit price bids were accepted on behalf of the Board of Park Commissioners on October 5th, 2021. Two bids were submitted for this project and Mudrack Tree Service is the lowest most responsive bidder for stumps larger than 6" diameter.

**Funding Source:** Budget - 121

**Estimated Start:** January 2022

**Estimated Completion:** December 2022

**Board Approval:**

We are asking the board to approve a stump removal contract with Mudrack Tree Service at a total cost of \$83,000.00.

---

The Fort Wayne Parks and Recreation and the Board of Park Commissioners, met to host their regularly scheduled monthly Board meeting on **December 9th<sup>th</sup>, 2021**, to approve funding for the above referenced contract, in the amount of **\$83,000.00**.

***We, the Board of Park Commissioners, on the date stated do ATTEST***, and sign to the above referenced and attached documents, and approve as presented.

---

**Richard Samek, President**

---

**Pamela Kelly, Vice President**

---

**William Zielke, Commissioner**

---

**Justin Shurley, Commissioner**

## 2021 STUMP REMOVAL BID TAB

	Mudrack Tree Service	Asplundh Tree	Worx Companies	Grind Pro
<b>Base Bid 1-Unit</b> <b>Price 1:</b> Complete stump removal package for tree stumps ranging from 2" DBH to 6" DBH to be identified at a later date and may be located anywhere within the city limits:	\$ <u>80.00</u> Per stump	\$ <u>No Bid</u> Per stump	\$ <u>69.60</u> Per stump	\$ <u>No Bid</u> Per stump
<b>Base Bid 2-Unit</b> <b>Price 2:</b> Complete stump removal package for tree stumps larger than 6 inch DBH to be identified at a later date and may be located anywhere within the city limits:	\$ <u>9.50</u> Per DBH Inch	\$ <u>No Bid</u> Per DBH Inch	\$ <u>17.40</u> Per DBH Inch	\$ <u>No Bid</u> Per DBH Inch